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ROMANS 12:1 AMPC 
11 The Pharisee stood and prayed thus with himself, ‘God, I thank You that 
I am not like other men—extortioners, unjust, adulterers, or even as this tax 
collector. 12 I fast twice a week; I give tithes of all that I possess.’ 13 And 
the tax collector, standing afar off, would not so much as raise his eyes to 
heaven, but beat his breast, saying, ‘God, be merciful to me a sinner!’ 14 I 
tell you, this man went down to his house justified rather than the other; for 
everyone who exalts himself will be humbled, and he who humbles himself 
will be exalted.” 
 
ROMANS 12:2 CEV 
11 The Pharisee stood and prayed thus with himself, ‘God, I thank You that 
I am not like other men—extortioners, unjust, adulterers, or even as this tax 
collector. 12 I fast twice a week; I give tithes of all that I possess.’ 13 And 
the tax collector, standing afar off, would not so much as raise his eyes to 
heaven, but beat his breast, saying, ‘God, be merciful to me a sinner!’ 14 I 
tell you, this man went down to his house justified rather than the other; for 
everyone who exalts himself will be humbled, and he who humbles himself 
will be exalted.” 
 
1 PETER 1:23 NKJV 
23 having been born again, not of corruptible seed but incorruptible, 
through the word of God which lives and abides forever. 
 
MARK 4:28-29 NKJV 
28 For the earth yields crops by itself: first the blade, then the head, after 
that the full grain in the head. 29 But when the grain ripens, immediately he 
puts in the sickle, because the harvest has come.” 



HEBREWS 4:12 NKJV 
12 For the word of God ​is​ living and powerful, and sharper than any 
two-edged sword, piercing even to the division of soul and spirit, and of 
joints and marrow, and is a discerner of the thoughts and intents of the 
heart. 
 
PSALMS 119:128 NKJV 
Therefore all ​Your​ precepts ​concerning​ all ​things  ​I consider ​to be​ right; I 
hate every false way. 
 
JAMES 1:21 NKJV 
21 Therefore lay aside all filthiness and overflow of wickedness, and 
receive with meekness the implanted word, which is able to save your 
souls. 
 
GALATIANS 5:16 NKJV 
16 I say then: Walk in the Spirit, and you shall not fulfill the lust of the flesh. 

 
PHILIPPIANS 2:13 NKJV 
13 for it is God who works in you both to will and to do for ​His​ good 
pleasure. 
 
PSALMS 37:3-5 NKJV 
Trust in the Lord, and do good; Dwell in the land, and feed on His 
faithfulness. 4 Delight yourself also in the Lord, And He shall give you the 
desires of your heart. 5 Commit your way to the Lord, Trust also in Him, 
And He shall bring ​it​ to pass. 
 
 


